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Dealer Contact 
Lincoln - Olson Marketing

Don & Peg Olson
ZO Referral# 4901

402-489-3930
http://om.shopamsoil.com
lubedealerdon@gmail.com

Omaha - Insane Oil
Dr. Jonathan D. & Stacey L. Olson

ZO Referral# 10458
402-990-7940 (text or call)

http://insaneoil.com
info@insaneoil.com

Congratulations:
New Preferred Customers

Lloyd Smith
Lincoln, NE

Chad Rutten
McCool Junction, NE

Gabriel Velilla
Winter Garden, FL

New Catalog Customers

Cody Powers
Monroe Township, NJ

in partnership with Insane Oil of Omaha

Amsoil Monthly Highlight: 
Severe Gear 75W-90

AMSOIL SEVERE GEAR® Syn-
thetic Extreme Pressure (EP) Gear 
Lube is a premium-grade gear oil 
specifically engineered for maxi-
mum performance in severe-duty 
applications. 

This state-of-the-art AMSOIL 
formulation features an exclusive 
blend of high-viscosity, shear-sta-
ble synthetic base oils and an ex-
tra treatment of high-performance 
additives. 

AMSOIL SEVERE GEAR Syn-
thetic EP Gear Lube maintains its 
viscosity for long-lasting protec-
tion against metal-to-metal con-
tact. 

The proprietary AMSOIL addi-
tives form an iron-sulfide barrier 
coating on gear surfaces, provid-
ing the ultimate line of defense 
against wear, pitting and scoring. 
AMSOIL SEVERE GEAR helps 
prevent "thermal runaway" — a 
phenomenon caused by a lubri-
cant's inability to control friction 
and increased heat under high-
stress conditions. By controlling 
thermal runaway, AMSOIL SE-
VERE GEAR Synthetic EP Gear 
Lube inhibits rapid lubricant deg-
radation and component damage. 
Equipment runs better and lasts 
longer with AMSOIL SEVERE 
GEAR Synthetic EP Gear Lube.

https://www.amsoil.com/shop/by-product/gear-lube/severe-gear-75w-90/?code=SVGPK-EA?zo=10458
http://www.amsoil.com/?zo=10458
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Cooling System Flush - DIY
A typical 4 cylinder vehicle cruis-
ing along the highway at around 
50 miles per hour,  will produce 
4000 controlled explosions per 
minute inside the engine as the 
spark plugs ignite the fuel in each 
cylinder to propel the vehicle 
down the road.  Obviously, these 
explosions produce an enormous 
amount of heat and, if not con-
trolled, will destroy an engine in 
a matter of minutes.  Controlling 
these high temperatures is the job 
of the cooling system.

The modern cooling system has 
not changed much from the cool-
ing systems in the model T back 
in the '20s.  Oh sure, it has be-
come infinitely more reliable and 
efficient at doing it's job, but the 
basic cooling system still consists 
of liquid coolant being circulated 
through the engine, then out to 

the radiator to be cooled by the air 
stream coming through the front 
grill of the vehicle.

Today's cooling system must 
maintain the engine at a constant 
temperature whether the outside 
air temperature is 110 degrees 
Fahrenheit or 10 below zero.  If 
the engine temperature is too 
low, fuel economy will suffer and 
emissions will rise.  If the tem-
perature is allowed to get too hot 
for too long, the engine will self 
destruct.

The cooling system is made up 
of the passages inside the engine 
block and heads, a  water pump 
to circulate the coolant, a thermo-
stat to control the temperature of 
the coolant, a radiator to cool the 
coolant, a radiator cap to control 
the pressure in the system, and 

some plumbing consisting of in-
terconnecting hoses to transfer 
the coolant from the engine to ra-
diator and also to the car's heater 
system where hot coolant is used 
to warm up the vehicle's interior 
on a cold day.

It is important to exchange old 
coolant with new to ensure the 
coolant is doing its job properly 
inside the engine.  I performed 
this task in my driveway a couple 
weeks ago and it wasn't overly dif-
ficult.  The existing coolant had 
been run for about 6 years and 
after conducting a pH test I deter-
mined that it needed replaced.  

I filmed the process and created 
a tutorial video.  Clicking on the 
video link below will take you to 
the entire tutorial.

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=Dq5YFSU6kAg
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=Dq5YFSU6kAg
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The Altrum Minute - New Supplements

Learn more at AltrumOnline.com

https://altrumonline.com/?zo=10458

